
Biography of Ajit Doval: The Enigma of India's
National Security Advisor

Ajit Doval, the current National Security Advisor of India, is a seasoned
intelligence officer and diplomat whose enigmatic personality has
captivated the nation. With a distinguished career spanning over four
decades, he has played a pivotal role in shaping India's national security
policies and countering terrorism. This article delves into the intriguing life
and illustrious career of Ajit Doval, shedding light on his remarkable
achievements and unwavering commitment to safeguarding India's
interests.

Early Life and Education

Ajit Doval was born on January 20, 1945, in a small town in Uttarakhand,
India. His father was a police officer, and his mother was a homemaker.
Doval grew up in an environment that instilled in him a strong sense of
patriotism and public service. He excelled in academics, graduating with a
Master's degree in Economics from Agra University.
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Joining the Intelligence Bureau (IB)

After completing his education, Doval joined the Intelligence Bureau (IB) in
1968. His exceptional analytical skills and keen eye for detail quickly
earned him recognition. Doval rose through the ranks of the IB, holding key
positions in both domestic and international intelligence operations.

Counterterrorism Operations

One of Doval's most significant contributions was his role in countering
terrorism. As the IB's Deputy Director, he masterminded the operation that
led to the liberation of 155 hostages in the 1981 Indian Airlines hijacking in
Kandahar, Afghanistan. Doval's courageous and innovative approach
earned him international acclaim and further cemented his reputation as a
counterterrorism expert.

Director of IB and Special Advisor

In 1999, Doval was appointed as the Director of the Intelligence Bureau,
becoming the youngest person to hold this prestigious position. He
implemented sweeping reforms, modernizing the IB's operations and
enhancing its intelligence-gathering capabilities. After retiring from the IB,
Doval served as a Special Advisor to the Prime Minister on National
Security issues.

National Security Advisor
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In 2014, Ajit Doval was appointed as the National Security Advisor of India
by Prime Minister Narendra Modi. In this capacity, he is responsible for
advising the Prime Minister on strategic matters, including national security,
foreign policy, and intelligence. Doval has played a crucial role in
formulating India's response to a range of security challenges, including
terrorism, cross-border infiltration, and cyber warfare.

Surgical Strikes and Balakot Airstrike

Doval is widely credited with orchestrating the surgical strikes conducted by
the Indian Army across the Line of Control in response to the 2016 Uri
attack. He also played a key role in the planning and execution of the
Balakot airstrike in February 2019, which was a major blow to Pakistan-
based terrorist groups.

Diplomacy and International Relations

In addition to his intelligence and counterterrorism expertise, Doval is also
a skilled diplomat. He has represented India in bilateral and multilateral
forums, advocating for India's interests and strengthening strategic
partnerships with key countries. Doval's diplomatic acumen has played a
vital role in resolving regional conflicts and promoting peace and stability in
the South Asian region.

Awards and Recognition

Ajit Doval has received numerous awards and accolades for his
extraordinary contributions to national security. These include the Kirti
Chakra, India's second-highest gallantry award, and the Padma Vibhushan,
India's second-highest civilian award. He has also been recognized



internationally for his counterterrorism efforts, receiving awards from the
United States, Israel, and Russia.

Ajit Doval is a true enigma, a man of few words but profound impact. His
intelligence, strategic brilliance, and unwavering commitment to India's
security have made him one of the most respected and influential figures in
contemporary Indian history. As India navigates complex and evolving
security challenges, Ajit Doval will undoubtedly continue to play a pivotal
role in safeguarding the nation's interests and securing its future. His
legacy as a visionary leader and a resolute defender of India will endure for
generations to come.
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